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completing sticker albums actively collecting and trading
stickers to complete sticker albums can also yield free
dice rolls incentivizing players to engage in sticker
collection and album completion participating in events
special events hosted by monopoly go offer additional
opportunities to earn free dice rolls active participation
and reaching milestones during events unlock valuable
rewards monopoly go also rewards players with free dice
through the app s daily login bonus which can be claimed
every eight hours more dice rolls can be claimed each
day as well by completing objectives in quick wins and
when you connect your monopoly go profile to your
facebook account or your phone s contact list dion has
wanted to be a video games journalist ever since he first
saw copies of gamesmaster and official playstation
magazine in his local newsagent as a kid and realised
there was a job that combined his two biggest passions
gaming and writing if this doesn t happen and the link
instead opens in a separate tab on your browser try
refreshing that page and see if the pop up menu appears
alternatively try clicking on the link again and see if that
triggers the menu if none of these troubleshooting tips
work try opening up the monopoly go app so it s running
in the background then head back here and try clicking on
the link again to see if that kicks things into gear
monopoly go also rewards players with free dice through
the app s daily login bonus which can be claimed every
eight hours more dice rolls can be claimed each day as
well by completing objectives in quick wins and when you
connect your monopoly go profile to your facebook
account or your phone s contact list to redeem one of the
links above simply click on it on the device you have
monopoly go installed on when you click on the link in
your browser you ll be taken to a new webpage and
asked if you want to open it in monopoly go monopoly go
also rewards players with free dice through the app s
daily login bonus which can be claimed every eight hours
more dice rolls can be claimed each day as well by
completing objectives in quick wins and when you
connect your monopoly go profile to your facebook
account or your phone s contact list
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