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this is a simple and effective way to gain the attention of
tiktok s most influential users pinpoint the most successful
musers in your niche and follow and unfollow them until
they follow you back although it may seem silly this
strategy actually works because after enough attempts
your favorite members of the platform will look at your
profile and follow you back if they like what they see try to
comment on their videos because tiktok stars share on
their profiles can potentially increase the chances of
being followed back especially if your comments are
always on point some of the people whose work you
appreciate maybe even willing to share their secrets and
help you get more followers lenovo will communicate with
you via email or push notifications including via the
standing on giants platform about legion community
related notices changes to features of legion community
and any notices required by law in lieu of communication
by postal mail if required by law we will ask you for
consent before sending you marketing emails please note
that you may unsubscribe to general marketing emails at
any time using the link provided in the emails you
understand that your data may be shared with other
lenovo entities and trusted third parties with a contractual
relationship with lenovo solely in connection with legion
community the platform may contain links to third party
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websites advertisers products services offers or other
events or activities that are not owned or controlled by
lenovo lenovo does not assume any responsibility for any
such third party sites information materials products
services or offers if you access any third party website
product service or content from the platform you do so at
your own risk and you agree that lenovo will have no
liability arising from your use of or access to any third
party website product service or content i have to admit
the shortcuts of growing tiktok followers are really
attractive however every coin has two sides have you
ever thought about the engagement rate of your content if
the followers are not real in the long run i suggest you
could try other tips to skyrocket growth on tiktok just keep
reading


